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Policy Statement

1. Council may waive fees for microchipping, vaccination and impounding of animals for 
residents of the Upper Hunter Shire Local Government Area who are suffering personal 
financial hardship pursuant to Section 610E of the Local Government Act 1993.

2. Council may determine whether a resident is suffering personal financial hardship based on 
the submission of appropriate documentary evidence.

Objective

To clearly state the circumstances under which Council will consider the personal financial 
hardship of a resident when it receives a request to waive fees relating to microchipping,
vaccination and impounding of animals. 

Scope

This policy applies to Council staff responsible for animal control services and residents of the 
Upper Hunter Shire Local Government Area who are suffering personal financial hardship 
pursuant to Section 610E of the Local Government Act 1993. 

Definitions

All terms used in this policy have the standard dictionary definition.

Policy Details

A resident who is suffering personal financial hardship may apply to Council for an exemption 
from the payment of microchipping, vaccination and impounding fees prior to the release of an 
animal from the pound. An application to waive fees must be accompanied by documentary 
evidence demonstrating financial hardship such as a pensioner concession card (blue card) or 
health care card. Other forms of evidence may be considered at the discretion of Council. 

Responsibilities

General Manager 

The General Manager will consider and determine applications for an exemption from the 
payment of microchipping, vaccination and impounding fees due to personal financial 
hardship in accordance with this policy.
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Director

The Director Environmental & Community Services will be responsible for the implementation 
of this policy and making recommendations to the General Manager in relation to applications 
for exemption from the payment of microchipping, vaccination and impounding fees due to 
personal financial hardship. 

Manager

The Manager Planning, Building & Regulatory Services will review, update and implement the 
policy. The Manager will also develop and maintain any procedures or processes required to 
manage the policy.

Compliance Officers 
Compliance Officers will ensure that customers that are unable to pay Council’s fees for 
microchipping, vaccination and impounding of animals are aware of this policy. 
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